
Monday October 1 
 

Woodley Park News 
 
WPCA elections. So far, the following members have indicated their intention to run in 
the October 16th elections: President, Bill Menczer; Vice President, Paul Poe; 
Treasurer, Warren Gorlick; Secretary, Peter Brusoe; At Large, Barbara Ioanes and Rob 
Meisnere. Contact Sarah Taber if you have any questions or are interested in running. 
Nominations can also be made from the floor at the meeting. 
 
ANC elections. Woodley Park is represented by four commissioners on Advisory 
Neighborhood Commission 3C. There is a contest for two of these positions in the 
November elections. These are districts 02 and 03, which includes the area just west of 
Connecticut Avenue (map here). WPCA is sponsoring a forum to hear from these 
candidates and ask them questions on Tuesday October 23 at 7:30 pm at Stanford. 
 
Neighborhood churches will have the blessing of the animals on Saturday October 6th 
in honor of the feast of St. Francis. St. Thomas Apostle Church at 10:30 am, 2665 
Woodley Road. All Souls Episcopal Church at 3 pm, 2300 Cathedral Avenue. 
 
The firm that is proposing to redevelop 2852 Connecticut Ave will describe the project 
at the October 3 WPCA Executive Committee meeting at approximately 8 pm. All are 
welcome to attend. Copies of the developer's drawings are on the website. 
 
You should have received the Fall issue of the WPCA Acorn in the mail. If you didn't, 
you can read it online. 
 
Help your neighborhood school. If you buy products with the "Box Tops for 
Education" , Oyster-Adams School would like your help by simply mailing the Box Tops 
to Oyster (2801 Calvert Street) or dropping them off at the school. Angela Juarez can 
answer any questions you might have. You can also help the school through the Giant 
and Safeway education programs. 
 
Calendar 
 
The Federation of Citizens Associations' program on "transit zones" that was originally 
planned for September 18th has been rescheduled for Tuesday October 2 from 6:45 to 
9 pm at All Souls Memorial Episcopal Church, 2300 Cathedral Avenue. 
 
The next meeting of the WPCA Executive Committee is Wednesday October 3 at 
Stanford starting at 7:30. The agenda should be on the website a few days before the 
meeting. 
 
WPCA Fall meeting is on Tuesday October 16th at 7 pm at Stanford. The Associate 
Director of the DC Office of Planning will discuss its proposals to rewrite DC's zoning 
regulations, with emphasis on what will — and will not — change in Woodley Park. 
WPCA elections are also on the agenda. 
 
Saturday October 20th is the date for the Woodley Park historical talk and walking 
tour. We’ll meet at 1 pm for the talk and some light refreshments. After the talk, there 



will be a neighborhood walking tour, lasting about 90 minutes. You can RSVP and get 
the meeting location here. Any questions, contact Jay Sushelsky. 
 
John Goodman 
WPCA 
For more information, visit http://www.wpcaonline.org/ 
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